

Obion County Schools

1. Cleaner/Deodorizer	Buckeye's Lemon Quat- One Step Disinfectant, Germicidal Detergent and Deodorant	\$56.00
2. Brooms	Lobby 100% Corn Broom (9" sweep, 3 sew, 30" long)	\$4.50
3. Mop Compound	Damp Mop- 5 gallon	\$35.00
4. Tile Floor Wax	Buckeye's Clarion 25- 5 gallon	\$70.00
5. Garden Sprayer	No Bid	No Bid
6. Glass Cleaner	Buckeye's Star Spray Concentrate Glass Cleaner- 5 gallon	\$76.00
7. Liquid Hand Cleaner	Buckeye's Green Sealed Certified Hand Cleaner- 6 cartridges per case, 1250 ml per bag	\$58.00
8. Cleaner Disinfectant	Buckeye's Lemon Quat- One Step Disinfectant, Germicidal Detergent and Deodorant	\$56.00
9. Bathroom Cleaner	NABC- quarts	\$2.95
10. Standard Strength Stripper	Buckeye's Ripsaw Floor Stripper- 5 gallon, butyl free	\$74.00
11. Rubber Gloves (Medium) (Large)	Rubber Latex Gloves case 10/100	Medium- \$32.00 Large- \$33.00
12. Spray Heads	Spray Head	\$0.70
13. Urinal Screens	Urinal Screens- cucumber melon scent, 10 per case	\$20.00
14. Scouring Pads	MaxiScour- Medium- Duty Scouring Pad	\$0.45
15. Screen Disc 20"	20 inch screen disc. 120 grit	\$5.25
16. Shop Towels	No Bid	No Bid
17. Disposable Gloves	Latex Gloves Non Sterile Powder Free- case 10/ 100	\$35.00
18. Feather Dusters	23" Ostrich Feather Duster	\$9.50
19. Wet Mop Frame w/ Handle	Quick-Way Janitor Mopstick, Wood Handle(Spring Action)	\$7.25
20. Lamb's Wool Pads	No Bid	No Bid
21. Dust Mop Handles	24 inch dust mop handle	\$4.25

22. Gym Floor Finish	Buckeye's Larry 40- 5 gallon	\$104.00
23. Cleaner/Degreaser	BH38- 5 gallon	\$36.00
24. Mop Buckets w/ Wringer	Mop Bucket & Wringer, Yellow- 36 quarts	\$65.00
25. Floor Polish	Buckeye's Clarion 25- 5 gallon	\$70.00
26. Dust Mop Heads (18") (36") (48")	Cut End Dust Mops	(18") \$5.00 (36") \$6.50 (48") \$8.25
27. Trash Can Liners (16x14x36) (22x14x58)	Trash Liners	(16x14x36) 1.5 mil, black, 300 per case - \$27.50 (22x14x58) 1.5 mil, black, 250 per case- \$21.50
28. Toilet Tissue	Gen 218 Toilet Tissue	\$28.50
29. Floor Pads 20 inch natural hair 20 inch white 20 inch black 20 inch green 20 inch red	Floor Pads	20 inch Natural Hair- \$16.25 White- \$16.25 Black- \$16.25 Green- \$16.25 Red- \$16.25
30. Dust Mop Frames (18") (36") (48")	Snap On Dust Mop Frames	(18") \$4.00 (36") \$5.00 (48") \$5.50
31. Janitor Cart	MaxiRough Janitor Cart	\$113.00
32.. Terrazzo Floor Finish	Buckeye's Clarion 25- 5 gallon	\$70.00
33. Dustpans	MaxiRough Plastic Dust Pan	\$3.00
34. Disinfectant Wipes	No Bid	No Bid
35. Facial Tissue	Facial Tissue- 100 sheet per box, 30 boxes per case	\$18.50
36. Absorbent	Spilleater Obsorb- 2 lbs	\$8.00
37. Bleach	Bleach- gallon	\$2.95
38. Laundry Detergent	No Bid	No bid
39. Wet Mop Heads	24 oz MaxiRough Cut End Mop	\$6.50

- Beaver Janitor Supply carries a variety of other products as well. Please feel free to contact me with any other items you may need.

Thank you,

Johnny Porzelt 573-837-9339